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Press Pub. Date :2008-05. This book includes: SQLServer2000
installation and basic operation. Transact-SQT languages.
integrity constraints. stored procedures. test. backup and
restore. database security control. Database technology is the
fastest growing field of information science and technology is
one of the widest range of applications. one of the most
practical technology. Database theory and application is an
application of the course. The experimental material is
introduced on database theory and application of the
monograph. the book is characterized by a theory with
practical. classroom teaching service. Classroom-related issues
as listed as an experimental proposition. the theory by
experiments to verify the problem. to achieve the purpose of
eliminating doubt and confusion. Contents: Chapter 1
Introduction Chapter sqlserver2000 installation and basic
operation of the Enterprise Manager sqlserver2000 experiment
a second experiment the basic operation of server
management sqlserver2000 Experiment 3 Enterprise Manager
to create databases and tables Experiment 4 sqlselver2000
Query Analyzer to create operating Experiment 5 Chapter
transact-view sql sql language experiment a language to
create. modify. delete database tables and table data...
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