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Derivatives Losses: Hearing Before the Committee on Banking,
Finance, and Urban Affairs, House of Representatives, One
Hundred Third Congress, Second Session, October 5, 1994 The
committee met, pursuant to notice, at 10 a.m., in room 2128,
Rayburn House Office Building, Hon. Henry B. Gonzalez
[chairman of the committee] presiding. Present: Chairman
Gonzalez, Representatives Kennedy, Flake, LaRocco, Roybal-
Allard, Barrett, Watt, Dooley, Fingerhut, Leach, McCollum,
Roukema, Baker, Thomas, Linder, Knollenberg, Lazio, and
Huffington. The Chairman. The committee will please come to
order. Let me say that we are meeting this morning in an
environment of quite a bit of turmoil legislatively. The House
convened at 9:30 this morning, and it is intended, at least as far
as what I know up to now, that there will be an adjournment of
some kind this Friday. So, naturally, the members are involved in
these last-minute very frenetic exercises. But that has been the
story all along. We have had several hearings on this subject
matter of today s hearing, and going back really 2 years, and
whether it...
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-- Ms. Gr a cie Nicola s     

A very awesome ebook with perfect and lucid information. It is really simplified but unexpected situations in the 50 %
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can be he greatest ebook for at any time.
-- Noa h B r uen    
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